THE EDINBURGH GAZETTE, 21st JUNE 1974 799

POST OFFICE
SCHEME P4/1974

ich follows this note has been made under Section 28 of the Post Office Act 1969 and amends the
Nmbﬂfircgehsﬂﬁilm%ogth lgchcflc'}nte 1972. The Scheme, which will coms into operation on 24th June 1974, provides for new

;’fﬂgﬁ tor letters, registered letters, parcels and various services.
(This note is not part of the Scheme).

THE POST OFFICE INLAND POST AMENDMENT (No. 5) SCHEME 1974

Made 31st May 1974

Coming into Operation ... 24th Fune 1974
The Post Office, by virtue of the powe<rs conferred upon it by Section 28 of the Post Officz Act 1969, and all other powers
pabling it in this behalf, hereby makes the following Scheme :

Commencement, citation and interpretation
1—1) This Schzme shall come into operation on 24th June 1974 and may be ated as the Post Office Inland Post Amend-

pent (No. 5) Scheme 1974.

(2) This Scheme shall be read as ons with the Post Office Inland Post Scheme 1972 (Post Office Scheme P7/1972) (here-
mafier called ©the Scheme ) as amended by the Post Office Amendment (No. 1) Scheme 1973 (Post Office Scheme P1/1973),
fe Post Offic= Inland Post Amendment (INo. 2) Scheme 1973 (Post Oifice Scheme I710/1973), the Post Office Inland IPost
im.ndment (No. 3) Scheme 1973 (Post Office Scheme P11/1973) and the Post Otficz Inland Post Amendment (No. 4) Scheme

1973 {Post Office Scheme P12/1973).

(3) The Inerpreration Act 1889 applies for the interpretation of this Scheme as it applies for the interpretation of an Act of
Palament and as if this Scheme wire an Act of Parliament.
Rates of postage and other charges and fees

—1) The following amendments are made to the Scheme:

a. In paragraph 6(2) for the amount “ 73p > there shall be subsututed “ 10p ™.

b. In paragraph 30(8) for the amount “ £5” there shall be substtuted “ £10”. In the case of a licence granted before the

day on which this Scheme comes into operation, the first annual fee under paragraph 30(8) of the Scheme shall be due

and payable on the relevant anniversary following on or next after that day, without prejudice to the right of the Post

Office to recover from the lecensee the amount of any fee due or payable before thar day under the provisions of the

Scheme which remaims unpaid.

In paragraph 30(9) for the amount “ £5” there shall be subsututed “ £10 ”,

d. In paragraphs 31(9), 31{10){a) and 31(11) for the amount “ £5 > wherever it oocours ithere shall be substituted in each case
“£10”. For the purposes of the application of sub-paragraphs (9), (10) and (11) of paragraph 31 in relation to a Freepost
Licence granted before the day on which this Schems comes into operation and in force on that day:

(@) if when that licence was granved the licensee was the licensee in respeiot of a Business Reply Licence, every anniversary
of the day when the Busimess Reply Licence was granted on which the Freepost Licence remains in force shall be a
relevant anniversary;

(b) in every other case, every anniversary of the day when that licence was granted and on which it remains in
force shall be a relevant anniversary;

and the first annual fee under those sub-paragraphs shall be due and payable on the relevant anniversary falling on or

next after the day on which this Scheme comes into operation, without prejudice to the might of the Post Office to

recover from the licensee the amount of any fee due and payable before that day under the provisions of the Scheme
which remains unpaid.

¢. gl&DETEngI“dphs 32(3), 40(3), 44(2) and 44(3) for the amount “4p > wherever it coccurs there shall be substituted in each

b 66 p”,
L. For sub-paragraphs (5) and (6) of peragraph 69 there shall be substituted the following:

") Wﬁgnl'wpect o the clearance through customs of a parcel or parcels stored in bond, the Post Office may charge a
as follows ; —

(@) Where a parcel or parcels are stored for a period not exceeding 28 days, the fee shall be 80p for each parcel,

elli_ligiplt)e where two or more parcels are posted simultaneously by a sender to the same addressee, when the fee
S L

(i) Where there are not more tthan 5 parcels:
_ 75p for each parcel
(i) Where there are more than 5 parcels but not more than 30 parcels:
75p for each of the first 5 parcels and then 50p for each additional parcel

(iif) Where there are more than 30 parcels:
for the first 30 parcels the fee for each as in (11) and then 27p for each additional parcel.

() When:c a parcel or parcels are stored for a period of more than 28 days, the fee for each parcel shall be as in
(@) with an additional sum for each parcel caloulated at the rate of 5p for each working day (or residual part
of such day) of svorage after the first 28 days ”.

(6) The fees chamg}:-i_tl under sub-paragraph (5) of this paragraph with respect to each parcel (other than a parcel which
s returned to its sender) shall be paid by the addressee if the parcel shall be delivered to him, or by the original
addressee if the parcel shall be re-addressed in accordance with (¢) or (d) of sub-paragraph (1).”

i :
me(n}[(gr? Z‘E"uhwmg amendments are made to Schedule 1 po the Scheme as amended by the Post Office Inland Post Amend-

o

) Scheme 1973
.. % Toritem 1 there shall be substituted the following item:
L. Lemer
(@) ?lor;tiemed (a) (1) For transmission as a {a) Rectangular and oblong (a) Not exceeding
3 _ first class letter ... 4ip the longer side being at 2 oz.
({1) For transmission as a least 1.414 tmes the
scocond class letter ... 3ip shorter
Length :

Max. 91 dinches
M. 51 tinches



200

(b) any other

THE EDINBURGH GAZZTTE, 21st JUNE 1974

‘b) (1) For transmission as a
first class letter-weight
not exceeding 2 0z.

Weight exceeding 2 oz. but
not exceeding 4 oz, ...
Exceedung 4 o0z. but not
exceedung 6 OZ. ...
Exceeding 6 o0z. but not
exceeding 8 oz, ...
Exceed.ng 8 0z. but not
excevding 10 oz. ...
Excecding 10 o0z. but not
exceeding 12 oz. ...
Exceeding 12 o0z. but not
exceeding 14 oz. ...
Exceeding 14 o0z. but not
exceeding 1 Ib. ...
Exceding 1 lb., but not
exceeding 1 1b. 8 oz, ...
Excead.ng 1 lb. 8 oz. but not
exceud.ng 2 lb. ...
Exceeding 2 Ib.:
For the first 2 1b. ...
For zach aaditicnal 4 lb. or
part thereof
(1) For transmission as a
second class letter-
weight not exceedmg
2 oz

Welght exceeding 2 oz. but
not excecdmg 4 oz.
Exceeding 4 o0z. but not
exceeding 6 oz. ...
Excsuiding 6 ocz. but not
excecdine 8 0z, ...
Excecdng 8 o©0z. bur not
exce.dng 10 oz. ...
Exceed e 10 oz. bur not
exc: dng 12 oz. ...
Exca.aung 12 cz. but not
=xcewcing 14 oz. ...
Exce.ding 14 oz. but nct
excaedng 1 1b, ...
Exceeding 1 1b.

Such
rate,
ot
exceed-
e

5ip, as
the
Post
Office
rmay fix

171p

32;p
425p
42:p
10p
rate,
ot
exceed-~
ng

43D, as

Post
Office

15p
17p

22% p 3

Widih:
mMax., 4, inches
Min. >3 inches
b) Lengih 2 feer
Widdh or depth 18 inches
Ih roll form:
ILength plus twice
diameter 3 feet 5 inches
Greatest dumension
2 feer 11 inches

b. For Column 2 of ditem 2 thers shall be substifuted the {cllowing:

“ Weight not exceeding 2 oz.
Exceading 2 oz.:
The rave specified wn atem
1{b)(11) which is epproprate
to irs welght >

3zp

c. For columns 1 and 2 of item 4 there shall be substituted thz following:

“4., Parcel:
(¢) ordinary

(b) local

Weizht not exceeding 2 1b.
Exc.cdmng 2 lb., but not
exceeding 4 Ib. ...
Exce.dng 4 1b. but not
exceedng 6 Ib. ...
Excesdirz 6 1lb. but not
excedinzg 8 1b. ...
Exceeding 8 1b. but not
sxceeding 10 1b. ...
Exceeding 10 b, but not
exceeding 12 1b. ...
Exceeding 12 1b. but not
excezding 14 1b. ...
Exceeding 14 1b. but not
exceading 16 lb. ...
Exceceding 16 1b. but mnot
exceeding 18 1b. ...
Exceeding 18 Ib. but not
exceeding 20 1b. ... :
Exceeding 20 1b.

The approprate Trate in
paragraph (@) minus 5p”

23p
30p
36p
42p
4p
53p
S58p
63p
68p

73p
78p

'-.b) \D No limits

(11} Not exceed-

mg L 1b. 8 oz.



THE EDINBURGH GAZETTE, 2ist JUNE 1974 801

(3) The following amendmenis are made to Schedule 2 to the Scheme:

1. For the amount in item 3 there shall bz substituted 57
5. For the amounts in item 4 there shall be respectively substituted < 10p *” and ‘¢ 20p .
.. For the amount in item 5 thesre shall be substimuted “ 20p ™.
4. For the amounts in item 6 there shall bz respectively substituted ** 10p ” and ¢ 20p ”.
¢. For the amount in item 7 there shall be substitur.d = 20p ™.
f. For the amounts in item 8 there shall bs rospectively substiruced *“ 10p ™ and ¢ 20p ™.
g. For item 9 there shall be substituted the following item:
«g Private Posting Boxes. Colleotion by the Past Office or postal packets {other than parcels) posted In a private posting
" pox (provided by che person requesting the fac.lity) of a design and in a position approved by the Post Office (not being
a private roadside letter box in a rural postal delivery ar.a):

(1) For iniual period of onz year or less:

(a) For each collzcuion, on six or fewer weeskdays 1in .very week £20

(b) For each collecticn on Sundays ... £20

(¢) Where the posting box is above or below ground Such fce ncot exceeding £20 as the Post Office may
floor — for each floor which the collector has fix, havingz ragard ro th: facdl nies available for ascent
to ascand or dzscend to make th2 collection. and dzscent.

(d) Distance fee, payable where the private posung |
s in a rural postal delivery area, and the cul- Such fee as thz Post Office may fix, hav.ng regard
lection in the op.nicn of the Post Offic2 involves to the cost of the excess travelling.

travzlling in excess of the normal rou.e of the
collecung offic.r.

(2) For each subsaquint full year or part thereof The fees chargeable under (1).”

h. Fcr the amcunts in paragraph All) of item 10 there shall bz rospeotiv.]ly substituted “ £20” and ““ £40 >,

;. For the amounss in paragraphs A(4) and A(5) of itzm 10 there shall bz r.spacidively substituted “ £40>, “ £207”
and “ £20 7.

i, In paragraph B of item 10 afier the words “ full year ” th.re shall be insemted “or part therecf .

k. Paragraph IC of item 10 i1s heriby rovoked.

l. For dtem 11 there shall bz substituted the follew.nz irem:

“11. Private Bags. Use of a private bag, that .s to say, a bag or other roc.pracle (provided by she own.r with the approval
of the Post Office) in wh'ch pos.al packets fer or from a particular address (i) in a town postal delivery area may either
be collected by the owner or his agiont or at the request of the owner be delivered at the place of address by the Post
Office, or may be posted by thz owner or his agent, or (i) in a rural posial delivery area may either be collected and
posted by the owner or his agent or be dzlivered at the place of address and collzored therefrom by the Post Office:

A. FPor an initial period of one year or less:
(I) Where the address concsrned is in a town postal delivery area:

Use of bag:

(@) For posting packets other than parcels or for posting parcels only ... £20

(b) For posting all classes of postal packets £40

(¢) For posting and collecting postal packets The fee appropriate under {a) or {b) plus the

appropr.ate fees under item 10A as if th2 bag were
a privare box.

(d) For delivery of postal packets by the Post Office at the place of address at ths aowner’s
rzquest, Fee for each delivery per day in the usual course of post payable in add.tion
to tha fees r.ferred to in {a), {b) and (¢) above £20

(2) Where the address ccncornod s in a rural pos:al d:livery area:
(¢) Bag collected and posited by the owner or his represenratve:

(1) Bag made up for one collection, on one or more days of ... £20

(1) Bag made up for more than one collection on one or more days of the weck £20 plus £20 each
making-up after
the first

(in) Additional fee where the bag is made available for collection at or after 6 a.m., and
before ths rms of commencement of the first delivery or the tim: of opening of

the post office to the public {(whichever is the earlier) - e £20

(b) Ba.g delivered and collected by the Post Office:
(f) Fer one delivery or collecticn on one or more days of the week ... £20
(i) For each addirional delivery or collzction on one or mare days of the week .. £20

(NOTE: —The fees referred 1o in (b) ars payable even though the bag is wsed only for the delivery of postal
yackets or only for their posting. If a deliverv and a collection are to be made at the same time
only one f:e is payable for such d:livery and collection.)

(¢) Distance fee, payable where the bag is collected Such fes as the Pcsy Office may fix, having regard
by the Post Office frcm an address in a rural to the cost of the excess travelling.
postal delivery area, and the collection in the
opiuon of the Post Office involves travelling in
€Xcess of the normal route of the collecting

officer.
(3) Ebiim’sion fes, payable in addition to the fees charg- As item 10A(4).
iilte; 1{'&%@)(1) or (2) in th2 dircumstances referred to
B.
For each subsequent full year or part thereof The fees chargeable under paragraph A ».

M. For the amcunts in item 12 there shall be ' i “ 7« S » «
the respechively substitured “ 75p £2 £5” and “ £17.
| n. For item 13 there shall be substituted the following item: ’ ’

13. D.W' : .
o ':fmp%g t.*ﬂf Postal Packets. Delivery of postal packets addressed to addressze’s private address at his business address,
his privar Packers address=d to one or more business addresses at another business address of the same addressee or at
i ¢ address, where th= fee mentioned in itemn 12 1s not applicabla:
or each

address from which packets are diverted, and for each style after the fi ] ich
Packers gre addrzssed to each such address: ‘ v ) > firstan whic



802

L 11 16

“ 19,

THE EDINBURGH GAZETTE, 21st JUNE 1974

(1) For initia]l period of one year or less ...

(2) For each subsequent full year or pant thereof . _ '
0. For the amount m stem 14 there shall be respectwely subsmlmted ¢ £20 S £5 » and T £5 »
p. For the amount m item 15 there shall be subsuituted ““ 10p .
q. For item 16 there shall be substituted the following item:

£40
£40>

Temporary Retention., thhholdmg of postal packerts from dehvery at the requ...st of the a :
not exceeding two months ... . | ’ ddl'e.sﬁﬁe for a period

r. For the amount in item 17 there shall be sub@mmred ‘¢ £20 »,
s. For mtem 19 there shall be substituteed the following item:

Special Collections
A. From an address in a rural postal delivery area: —
(1) For initial period of one year or less:

(a) For one collection, cn seven or fewer days of the
week

(b) For each aaddmmna.l cullmtron, on seven or fewer
days of the week .

(¢) Distance fee, prayablﬂ whe&re the collec'mn n the
opinion of the Post Office involves traveliing in

&4

Annual fee £20

Annual fee £20

excess of the normal rouwe of the collecting

officer.
(2) For each subsequent full year ...
(3) For a subsequent part only of a year

B. From an address in a town postal delivery area

Such fee as the Post Office may fix, havi
to the cost of the excess mvelhtylg iog g

The fees chargeable under (1).

za )rateable proportion of the fees chargeable under
Such fee for each collection as the Post Office may
fix, having regard to the number of items invol

t. In item 20 for the amount of “ £1.50 > there shall be substituted cn both occasions where is occurs “ £3
(4) The following amendments are made to Column 2 of Schedule 3 to the Scheme:

a. In items 1, 2 and 4 for the amount of ¢ 20p > there shall be substituted * 50p .

b. In ttem 3 for “20p” and * 30p * there shall be substituted respectively “ 40p ” and “ 60p °.
c. Inatem 7 for * S5p* there shall be substututed ** 20p .

d. In item 8 for “ £17” there shall be substituted “ £2 7.

(5) For Part I of Schedule 4 40 the Scheme there shall be substituted the following:

“TPART 1

Registration fees and corresponding maximum compensation

Column 1
Regisiration fee
(in addition to postage)
25p
(minimum registration fee)
30p
35p

Dated 31st May 1974.

Column 2
Maximum compensation
according to fee pad
£150

£300
£5007

Signed on behalf of the Post Office by Nigel N, Walmsley (a person authorised by the Pest Office to act in that behalf).

POST OFFICE SCHEME P5/74

NOTE: —The Scheme which fcllows this note amends The
Post Office (Postal Order) Scheme 1971. The amending scheme
which comes into operation on 24th June 1974 provides for
an increase in the fee payable for postal orders for denM1namons
from S5p up to and including 50p.

(This note 15 not part of the Scheme).

THE POST OFFICE (POSTAL ORDER)
AMENDMENT (No. 3) S *ME 1974
Made 3rd Fune 1974
Coming into operatton 24th Fune 1974
The Post Office, by virtue of the powers conferred upon it by

Section 28 of the [Posrt Office Act 1969, and of all other powers
enabling at in this behalf, hereby makes ‘the following Scheme: —

Commencement and citatton:
1. This Scheme

(@) shall come into operation on the 24th day of June 1974;

(b) may be cited at the Post Office (Postal Order) Amend-
ment (No. 3) Scheme 1974;

(c¢) shall be read as one with The Post Office (Postal
Order) Scheme 1971 (Post Office Scheme P5/1971)
(hereinafter called “the Scheme ), The Post Office

(Postal Order) Amendment (No. 1) Schemﬁﬂigﬂfp (Post
Office Scheme P4/1973) and The P(:irsz;:73 o O
Order) Amendment (No. 2) Scheme 1

Schem= P9/1973).

Interpretation: ——

2. The Interpretation Act 1889 applies for tl(;f1 lg;eafg jwer
of this Scheme as it applies for the enterpretati

Parliament.

Fee on Issue of Postal Orders:

by the
3. For the Schedule to the Scheme as sugjc'u;uctlfdent? 973
Post Office (Postal Order) ent Schedulei—
there shal]l be substituted the following
‘““ Paragraph 5
THE SCHEDULE
FEE ON ISSUE OF POSTAL ORDERS o
Denomination ol oy
Any denomination up to and including )

£2, £3, £4 or £5 . g
£l6: £7: £3, £9 or £10 .o R van
Dated 3rd June 1974.

iened on behalf of the Post Office by
authfmsgg by the Post Office 10 act in that ‘behalf).



